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Abstract: In this study, various aspects rela-
ted to Schizoid Personality Disorder (SPD) in 
gifted individuals were discussed. Discussions 
included the definition and diagnostic criteria 
of SPD, prevalence and comorbidities, speci-
fic behavioral traits, the impact of depression, 
healthy habits and coping strategies, as well 
as appropriate therapeutic interventions and 
support for these individuals. The neurobiolo-
gy and genomics of ASD and giftedness were 
also addressed, with a comparative analysis of 
the brain regions, neurotransmitters, genes 
and variants involved. The importance of stu-
dying ASD in gifted individuals was highligh-
ted, considering the cognitive and emotional 
particularities that can influence the manifes-
tation of the disorder.
Keywords: Schizoid personality disorder, gif-
tedness, behavioral traits, depression, healthy 
habits, coping strategies, neurobiology, geno-
mics, therapeutic interventions.

INTRODUCTION
Schizoid Personality Disorder (SPD) is a 

psychiatric condition characterized by a chro-
nic pattern of social withdrawal, emotional 
coldness and indifference to interpersonal re-
lationships. Although SPD is widely studied 
in the general population, research into its 
manifestation in gifted individuals remains li-
mited. Giftedness, defined by exceptional cog-
nitive abilities, is often accompanied by uni-
que emotional and social challenges that can 
mask or exacerbate symptoms of PTSD. Stu-
dying PTSD in gifted individuals is extremely 
important, as these individuals can display a 
complex combination of behavioral traits that 
affect their quality of life, academic perfor-
mance and social integration. Understanding 
these interactions is crucial to developing ef-
fective therapeutic interventions that take into 
account the specific needs of this population, 
thus promoting a more precise and personali-
zed management of PTSD.

DEFINITION AND DIAGNOSTIC 
CRITERIA
Schizoid Personality Disorder (SPD) is 

characterized, according to the DSM-5, by a 
persistent pattern of withdrawal from social 
relationships and a restricted range of emotio-
nal expression in interpersonal contexts. This 
pattern usually begins in early adulthood and 
manifests itself in a variety of contexts, inclu-
ding at least four of the following criteria: nei-
ther desiring nor liking intimate relationships, 
preferring solitary activities, little or no desire 
for sexual experiences, pleasure in few or no 
activities, absence of close friends other than 
first-degree relatives, indifference to praise or 
criticism from others, and emotional coldness 
or affective detachment (Huprich, 2010).

When considering gifted individuals, the 
manifestation of these diagnostic criteria can 
be complex due to the nature of their cognitive 
and emotional characteristics. Studies indica-
te that giftedness, commonly associated with 
greater emotional sensitivity and advanced 
cognitive processes, can mask or exacerbate 
certain schizoid traits. For example, the beha-
vior of preferring solitary activities, a central 
criterion of ASD, can be misinterpreted as a 
trait of giftedness, especially when the indivi-
dual engages in intellectually stimulating acti-
vities in isolation (Misir; Alptekin, 2020).

Diagnostic accuracy is crucial in differen-
tiating between schizoid personality traits and 
the behavioral characteristics of giftedness. 
The presence of eccentric or isolated beha-
viors, which could be accepted or even expec-
ted in highly intelligent individuals, should 
be analyzed with caution. Without a detailed 
assessment, these traits can lead to incorrect 
diagnoses, affecting the therapeutic approa-
ch and the individual’s prognosis (Esterberg; 
Goulding; Walker, 2010).
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In summary, the identification of PTSD in 
gifted individuals requires a clinical approach 
that takes into account the specificities of gif-
tedness and its interactions with classic diag-
nostic criteria. Future studies should continue 
to explore these nuances in order to refine 
diagnostic and therapeutic practices, ensuring 
that the behavioral traits of the gifted are cor-
rectly interpreted in the context of potential 
personality disorders.

NEUROBIOLOGY AND 
GENOMICS
Research into the neurobiology and geno-

mics of Schizoid Personality Disorder (SPD) 
and giftedness reveals intriguing aspects of 
brain morphology, neurotransmitters invol-
ved and genetic variants associated with these 
conditions. Recent studies indicate that brain 
regions such as the prefrontal cortex and hi-
ppocampus, which are associated with emo-
tional regulation and memory, may show 
structural differences in individuals with 
PTSD. These regions are also relevant in the 
context of giftedness, where hyperactivity of 
certain cognitive areas may be present (Douet 
et al., 2014).

At the molecular level, neurotransmitters 
such as glutamate, mediated by NMDA recep-
tors, have been implicated in both PTSD and 
related disorders such as schizophrenia and 
autistic spectrum disorders. Dysfunction in 
these receptors may be linked to cognitive and 
emotional deficits, which are central to ASD. 
In terms of giftedness, alterations in glutama-
tergic signaling may also be associated with 
cognitive overload and heightened emotional 
sensitivity, common characteristics in gifted 
individuals (Ohi et al., 2012).

Genetically, variants in genes such as ZN-
F804A and NRG1, associated with brain de-
velopment and synaptic regulation, have been 
identified in studies of both ASD and gifted-
ness. These variants can influence brain mor-

phology and neuronal connections, contribu-
ting to the clinical manifestations observed in 
both conditions. In particular, the rs6994992 
polymorphism in the NRG1 gene has been 
associated with alterations in the structural 
development of the brain, affecting areas such 
as the frontal lobe, which is crucial for both 
executive control and emotional processing 
(Stefanis et al., 2012; Douet et al., 2014).

The comparative analysis of these condi-
tions suggests that, although there is overlap 
in some neurobiological and genetic pathwa-
ys, such as those related to synaptic signa-
ling and cortical development, differences in 
the expression of these genes and associated 
epigenetic modifications may be responsible 
for the distinct phenotypic manifestations of 
ASD and giftedness. Understanding these va-
riations is essential for developing more pre-
cise and personalized therapeutic approaches.

PREVALENCE AND 
COMORBIDITIES
The prevalence of Schizoid Personality Di-

sorder (SPD) in gifted individuals is an area of 
study that still lacks comprehensive research. 
However, the literature suggests that gifted-
ness may be associated with greater vulnera-
bility to SPD due to the peculiar characteris-
tics of these individuals, such as a tendency 
towards social isolation and restricted inte-
rests, which can be confused with the symp-
toms of SPD (Vannucchi et al., 2014). The 
presence of psychiatric comorbidities, such 
as depression, anxiety and autistic spectrum 
disorders, is common among individuals with 
PTE, and such conditions can exacerbate PTE 
symptoms, making diagnosis and treatment 
more complex (Hossain et al., 2020).

Studies indicate that the comorbidity be-
tween ASD and autistic spectrum disorders 
is particularly relevant, since both can share 
characteristics of social isolation and commu-
nication difficulties. This overlap can lead to 



 4
Revista Brasileira de Saúde DOI https://doi.org/10.22533/at.ed.1595122524024

misdiagnosis, especially in gifted individuals, 
where eccentric or socially isolated behaviors 
can be misinterpreted as normal or as part of 
the characteristics of giftedness (Cook; Zhang; 
Constantino, 2019). In addition, anxiety and 
depression are often observed as comorbidi-
ties in individuals with ASD, further aggrava-
ting the clinical picture and requiring a multi-
faceted therapeutic approach (Hollocks et al., 
2018).

SPECIFIC BEHAVIORAL TRAITS
Schizoid Personality Disorder (SPD) is 

characterized by a persistent pattern of de-
tachment in social relationships, emotional 
coldness, and a marked preference for soli-
tary activities. These behavioral traits can be 
intensified or modulated by giftedness, given 
the cognitive and emotional complexity asso-
ciated with gifted individuals. Studies indicate 
that giftedness can influence the expression 
of schizoid traits in a distinct way, potentially 
exacerbating social isolation and interperso-
nal difficulties due to the possible discrepancy 
between the intellectual capacities and social 
skills of these individuals (Attademo; Bernar-
dini; Spatuzzi, 2021).

Emotional coldness, a central feature of 
PTSD, can manifest itself even more pro-
nouncedly in gifted individuals, given that 
they can develop cognitive coping strategies 
that reinforce emotional detachment and the 
minimization of affective responses in inter-
personal situations. This tendency can be mi-
sinterpreted as indifference or arrogance on 
the part of colleagues and family members, 
making it even more difficult to form social 
bonds (Huprich, 2010).

In addition, a preference for solitary acti-
vities is a trait widely observed in individuals 
with ASD, and in the gifted, this characteris-
tic can be exacerbated by the desire to engage 
in intellectually stimulating activities that are 
often carried out in isolation. This combina-

tion can reinforce the cycle of social isolation, 
especially if there is not adequate recognition 
of the social and emotional needs of these in-
dividuals (Zhang et al., 2019).

IMPACT OF DEPRESSION
Depression is a frequently observed co-

morbidity in individuals with Schizoid Per-
sonality Disorder (SPD), and its presence can 
have a significant impact on their quality of 
life, academic performance and interpersonal 
relationships. In gifted individuals, the coexis-
tence of SPD and depression can be particu-
larly complex, due to the interaction between 
high cognitive abilities and increased emotio-
nal vulnerability.

Studies show that depression in individuals 
with PTE is associated with worsening symp-
toms of social isolation and anhedonia, which 
can result in a deterioration in quality of life. 
These individuals tend to report low levels of 
life satisfaction, especially in areas related to 
social interaction and emotional well-being 
(Klang et al., 2021). In gifted individuals, this 
dissatisfaction can be exacerbated by high 
personal and external expectations, which 
further exacerbate the perception of failure 
and isolation.

Academic performance is also impacted by 
depression in individuals with ASD. Gifted in-
dividuals with ASD may show a marked decli-
ne in academic performance, not due to a lack 
of intellectual ability, but due to an inability to 
manage the emotional stress and pressure as-
sociated with their academic responsibilities. 
Depression, in this context, can lead to a loss 
of interest and motivation, resulting in sub-
-optimal performance (Choteau et al., 2016).

In interpersonal relationships, the combi-
nation of PTSD and depression can intensify 
difficulties in social interaction. Individuals 
with PTE already have inherent difficulties 
in forming and maintaining meaningful in-
terpersonal relationships, and depression can 
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exacerbate this condition, increasing emotio-
nal detachment and the inability to engage in 
healthy social relationships (Fonseca-Pedrero 
et al., 2011). As a result, depression acts as an 
additional risk factor for extreme social iso-
lation, which can perpetuate a cycle of lone-
liness and emotional suffering.

HEALTHY HABITS AND COPING 
STRATEGIES
The adoption of healthy habits, such as 

adequate sleep, a balanced diet and regular 
physical exercise, plays a fundamental role in 
the management of Schizoid Personality Di-
sorder (SPD) and depression in gifted indi-
viduals. Studies indicate that regular physical 
exercise not only improves clinical symptoms 
and quality of life, but also significantly re-
duces depressive symptoms, contributing to 
the overall functioning of these individuals 
(Dauwan et al., 2016). In addition, adequate 
nutrition and quality sleep are critical compo-
nents for maintaining mental health, directly 
influencing neurophysiological processes that 
can mitigate the progression of psychiatric di-
sorders (Wong & Raine, 2022).

In the context of coping strategies, thera-
peutic approaches such as Cognitive-Beha-
vioral Therapy (CBT), Acceptance and Com-
mitment Therapy (ACT) and mindfulness 
techniques have shown significant efficacy in 
reducing symptoms of PTSD and depression. 
CBT, for example, is widely used to modify 
dysfunctional thought patterns and promote 
adaptive behaviors, thus improving emotional 
control and self-efficacy (Klosterkötter, 2014). 
ACT, on the other hand, focuses on accepting 
negative thoughts and emotions while promo-
ting commitment to actions in line with perso-
nal values, and is a complementary approach 
that can also be integrated into the treatment 
of PTSD (Graff, McClure & Siever, 2014). 
Mindfulness techniques have been especially 
effective in reducing symptoms of anxiety and 

depression, contributing to a state of mindful-
ness that improves emotional regulation and 
reduces stress (Sizoo & Kuiper, 2017).

INTERVENTIONS AND SUPPORT
The literature on therapeutic interventions 

for gifted individuals with Schizoid Persona-
lity Disorder (SPD) highlights the need for 
approaches that take into account the cogniti-
ve and emotional particularities of this group. 
Individual therapy is often recommended, 
especially in formats that allow treatment to 
be adapted to the unique needs of the gifted. 
Approaches such as Cognitive-Behavioral 
Therapy (CBT) have shown efficacy in impro-
ving psychosocial functioning and reducing 
social isolation, promoting the development 
of social skills and mitigating emotional dis-
turbances (Mankiewicz; Renton, 2019).

Group therapy can also be a viable option, 
although special care must be taken when set-
ting up groups to ensure that participants feel 
comfortable and understood in an environ-
ment that respects their intellectual capacities 
and emotional sensitivities. Psychosocial su-
pport programs, which include interventions 
aimed at improving quality of life and streng-
thening social support networks, are essential 
to complement individual therapy, providing 
a structured environment and ongoing su-
pport for these individuals (Pitkänen; Puo-
lakka, 2013).

Studies indicate that combining psycho-
therapy with psychosocial interventions can 
offer robust support for individuals with PTE, 
helping to address both the symptoms of the 
disorder and the social and emotional needs 
that may not be fully resolved by individual 
therapy (Bozzatello et al., 2018).
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CONCLUSION
This study reviewed crucial aspects of Schi-

zoid Personality Disorder (SPD) in gifted in-
dividuals, highlighting the complexity of its 
manifestation due to the unique cognitive and 
emotional characteristics of these individuals. 
It was observed that giftedness can both mask 
and intensify the symptoms of SPD, making 
diagnosis challenging and negatively influen-
cing quality of life, academic performance 
and interpersonal relationships. In addition, 
comorbidities such as depression and anxiety 
exacerbate the impacts of the disorder, rein-
forcing the need for personalized therapeutic 
interventions. It is recommended that future 

research further explores the interaction be-
tween giftedness and ASD, especially in ter-
ms of neurobiology and genomics, in order 
to identify specific biomarkers that can aid 
in early diagnosis and personalization of tre-
atment. It is crucial to develop and test the-
rapeutic interventions that take into account 
the particularities of these individuals, such as 
psychosocial support programs and innovati-
ve therapeutic approaches, including the inte-
gration of mindfulness techniques, cognitive-
-behavioral therapy and neurofeedback-based 
interventions. These efforts could contribute 
to more effective management and a signifi-
cant improvement in the quality of life of gif-
ted people with ASD.
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